2020 Income Tax (Standard Deduction for Individuals) Amendment No. 17

Examined and certified by: W _
Actihg-Clerk of the Parliament

In the name and on behalf of Her Majesty Queen Elizabeth the Second I hereby assent to
this Act this g % day of d AL, 2020
)

~J T ans
Quwré@ﬁtaﬁveég/ £

Contents
1 Title |
2 Commencement 1
3 Principal Act amended 2
Part 1
Amendments in force 1 January 2020
4 Section 44 amended 2
5 Schedule 2A substituted 2
6 2020 income year 2
Part2
Amendments in force 1 January 2021
7 Section 44 amended 2
8 Schedule 2A substituted 2
Schedule 1
Schedule 2A substituted
PAYE Schédule from 1 January 2020
Schedule 2
Schedule 2A substituted
PAYE Schedule from 1 January 2021
An Act to amend the Income Tax Act 1997 to incrementally increase the
standard deduction for individuals under the Act.
The Parliament of the Cook Islands enacts as follows—
1 Title
This Act is the Income Tax (Standard Deduction for Individuals) Amendment
Act 2020,
2 Commencement _
(D This Act, except for Part 2, is deemed to have come into force on 1 January
2020.

(2) Part 2 comes into force on 1 January 2021.

X

congebamn o



Income Tax (Standard Deduction for Individaals) Amendmnent - 2020, No. 17

3 Principal Act amended
This Act amends the Income Tax Act 1997 (the principal Act).

Part1
Amendments in force 1 January 2020

4 Section 44 amended
(1)  In section 44(1)(a)(ii), omit “$11,000” in each place where it appears and

substitute “$12,8007. .
(2)  Insection 44(1)(b), item a of the formula, omit “$11,000” in each place where
it appears and substitute “$12,800”.

5 Schedule 2A substituted
Schedule 2A is repealed and the Schedule 2A set out in Schedule 1 of this Act

is substituted.

6 2020 income year
(1)  Ataxdeduction or payment of income tax made in accordance with the principal

Act before this Act is passed is lawfully made.
(2} The Collector must refund any tax that a person pays in the 2020 income year
that is in excess of the amounts required by—
(a) section 44 of the principal Act as amended by section 4 of this Act; and
(b) Schedule 2A of the principal Act as substituted by section 5 of this Act.
(3) A person’s retund under subsection (2) must be made during the person’s tax
assessment for the 2020 income year after the person has furnished an annual
return to the Collector for that year.
(4) If the Collector is satisfied that a person has already been assessed for income
tax for the 2020 income year, the Collector must—
(a) amend the relevant assessments for the 2020 income year to reflect the
amendments referred to in subsection (2); and
(b) refund any excess of the amounts that must be paid for the 2020 income
year.

Part 2
Amendments in force 1 January 2021

7 Section 44 amended

(1)  In section 44(1)(a)(ii), omit “$12,800” in each place where it appears and
substitute “$14,6007.. _ ‘

(2)  Insection 44(1)(b), item a, omit “$12,800” in each place where it appears and
substitute “$14,600”.

8 Schedule 2A substituted
Schedule 2A is repealed and the Schedule 2A set out in Schedule 2 of this Act

is substituted.




68'9Z7 60ZT

LE'STL £EB ¥8'se LSY 1€ 85¢
99T 80T 01°s¢t (4 £9°GE oSt ¥S'E £92
9E'9¢Z £0ZT 874" TES 05°'5¢ 55514 LE'E 99z
80°9¢C 90¢T 957t 0t £E'qL L2577 0T §9¢
18'6sZZ [eras [SYda A 628 aT°'se =24 E0'E 9T
R4 rOTT [l 74" 878 66 FE [4°14 98'c €97
LTSET £0¢T QL'ECT 128 8rE TSy - 69°¢ 9¢
00°8ZZ o0eT B ECT 9¢8 SO'VE ost Z8'C 192
£LPee 10€T TZECT qze 8t vE (51744 SE'Z 09z
ot 0021 e TCT res TEvE i 8T'Z 652
6T%2¢ 66TT L9'2CT £8 PI'¥E Ly 10z 2174
€6'ELT 8611 Obeet [44] LB°EE ori 3T LST
S9°ECC L6TT ETTZT TR 08'EE St 9T 9s¢
A 96Tt SBR'IZT 0743 €9°CE i 08T 1514
17°gCt SETT BS'TZT 618 ot'EE e EE'T 1°T4
+8'TZT ¥ETT ZE1CT 818 6T EE hr 9T'T £5¢C
LS°¢ZT £6TT S0"1ZT L18 ZT'Ee Tt 66°0 8¢
0£'ZZ¢ Z6TT BLOLT 918 S6'ZE Ot¥ €80 152
£02Ce 16TT TS0CT SI8 BL'ZE 6EY S9°0 0s¢
9L 1T 06TT A4 718 T9'2E sev a0 5174
S arad 68TT £6'6TT £18 IS LEY €0 8te
ZeTLC 0/°6TT 718 LTIE 9EY 10 JA 4

£PTS MOJIq S3WODU;

Apaam uo xey oN

0T0T Atenuep | woay d[npayds FAVd

PAIINSANS YT I[NPIYS
I a[npayds

¢S

JUSWPUSWY (S[ENPIAIPUY JOJ UOHINDA( PAEPUE)S) XB], SWOIUY hm c|Z ‘0Z0Z



PE'9ET
LO'9ET
08'SEZ
ES'SET
9Z'sEe
66°VET
TLPET
StPeET
8T'veT
TO'EET
¥9'EET
LE'EET
OT'EET
E€8'CET
95'¢etT
6T°CET
Z0eeT
SLTET
8P 1EC
1Z°1eC
¥6'0ET
19°0€T
ot'oee
ET0ET
98'6CC
65°6¢¢
[44 144
sSQ'6CZ
8L'8¢C
TS'8¢T
PT'BET
L6'LZT
04'£22
Evize
9T°LTT

274"
1374
[474"
374"
oret
6ECT
8€TT
LETT
9ttT
SECT
YECT
€ETT
CECT
TECT
0gZt
6TCT
8TLT
LTZT
=TAA
SzZeT
¥ZeT
L TA
[£44"
TZZt
0zt
6TCT
81T
LTTT
91T
STZT
144"
ETCT
[Ar4>
TTZT

LY "ON ‘0707

8'vET
SGPET
BCPET
TOPeT
PLEET
LY'EET
OC'EET
€6'CET

99°ZeT
GECET
CTZET
G8'TET
85TET
TETET
POTET
LLOET
0S0ET
ET0ET
966C1
69621

[4:4+14"
ST'62T
88821
T19'8CT
PE'BTT
L0821
08°LeT
ES°LTT
oTLTT
66921
TL9TT

Syazt
8T9ZT

64T
[4-N4
Sy

8CT'TY
TT'T¥

¥e'or
LLOF
09°0F
£V Or
9z'0F
60°0F

T6°6E
SL6E
89°6€

T'6E
¥Z'ee

L0°6E
06'8e
€L°8E
958k
6E°BE
[44:13
50'8¢
88'LE
TLLE
veLE
LE'LE
0T’LE

E0°Le
98'9¢
69°9¢

5'9¢
S€9g

8T'9€
T0'9E

MIAWPUIWY (S[enpIAIPU] 10§ HORINPA(] PIEPEE)S) XL, duIoduy

99’6
6’5
ZE'S
ST'6
868
T8'8
¥9'8
L8
0E'8
£T'R
96'L
6L'L
[4:4
StL
BTL
Te
¥6'9
£L9
093
'3
979
609
[4:34
8L
89S
s
¥Z's
LO'S
06t
£LY
95t
GE'Y
[44 4
S0¥

£0€E
o€
TOE
00€
667
867
L6T
962
562
62
£67
z6T
162
062
682
882
82
9gz
8T
8T
£87
78T
182
08z
642
8/7
1Lz
9(Z
SLz
LT
€LZ
uz
1724
0Lz



64'SYT
[4R51 /4
STSYL
86'v¥e
TLtbe
vt
LTHYE
06'E¥e
ESEVT
SE'EYC
60°E¥T
[4: )4 74
SS°T¥C
8L
T0Tve
PLTVE
LY I¥e
0Z'1¥e
£6°0¥Z
29°0¥C
BE"0vT
cT'oYe
S86ET
85'6EC
TE'6ET
0'6eC
LLBET
05'8eT
EC'BET
96°LeT
69°LET
Y LET
ST'LET
88'9CC
T9'9£2

LTl
00'virT
ELEVT
¥ EYT
5185 4
[4d-3a 4"
S9'CHT
8ETPT
114"
PeIPT
LSTHT
GETYT
E0'TPT
9L'0FT
&¥ OvT
[ds; 4¢
S6'6EL
89°6ET
T¥6ET
PLGET
L8BET
09°8ET
£EBET
90°8ET
6L LET
CS'/ET
ST'LET
86'9ET
TL9ET
P 9ET
L19ET
06'SET
E9'SET
9E'SET
60°9ET

gEE
LEE
9tE
SEE
PEE
EEE
7EE
TEE
OEE
6Z€
$TE
fird>
9zE
SZE
tZE
€28
ZeE
1ZE
0zE
61E
81¢
LIE
9IE
SIE
453
£TE
[443
1T¢
01€
6OE
80€
108
90%
S0g
+#0E



¥ZSSe
LE'FST
4108 4°14
eV ST
9T'sT
68'€ST
Z9°EST
SE'EST
BO'EST
18'¢se
LA
LTese
00'esz
ELTST
S’ 1ST
61°TST
26°0sZ
S90Sz
8E'05¢C
TT°05¢
86t
£5'6¥C
0E6%T
E0°6¥Z
9L°8¥%Z
&¥'8ire
[44:1 74
S6°Le
83 LPT
T ive
ANA 14
L8'9%T
09°9¥2

LT "ON ‘0707

ZLEST
St eST

8T'EST
T6'Z9T
¥9'ZsT
LETST

0T'zst
£8'TST
99'TST
6C'TST
cO'1ST
SL0ST
8F°0ST
1Z°05T
YE'6vL
L9'6YT
Ot"eFT
ET'6YT
OB'8YT
6S'8YT
CEBYT
SO'8FT
8LLFT
TS°LPT
Ve ivT
LO'9FT
09T
EV'orT
9T 9vT
68'SPT
[4:a=1 48
SE'SFT
80°S¥T
144 274"
¥SEPT

WRUPUSWY (S[ENPIAIPU] 10} UONINPI( PIBPULIS) XE[, SUI0dU]

60°8S
75°ES
SE'ES
8T°£S
TO'€ES
v8'zZs
£9ZS
0S'ZS
£€°7S
ST'ZS
6615
7815
5915
8IS
TETS
v1°1S
L6°05
080§
£9'08
9t°0s
6708
105
S6'6F
816
19°6¥
vir6r
LT6Y
OT'6¥
£6'8F
918t
658
ey
Szl

-BO'8Y

164

29§
T89S
0ss
695
855
LSS
958
555
sg
€SS
€SS
185
085
6tS
8FS
LS
=17
Sys
¥rS
£rs
s
s
Ors
6ES
8ES
LES
9ES
SES
PES
£ES
ZES
1eS
0ES
62S
BZS

C 9812
-BE1T-

[4aT4
SO TE
88'0¢
TL0T
¥5'0¢
Le'0Z
0Z'0z
£002
og'et
69'6T
56T
SE'6T
8T°'6T
TO'6T
28T

£9°8T-

0581
EC8T

9181

66°LT
CB'LT
S9°LT
8Ll

TELT

PTLT
L6'9T
08’91

£9°9T

St'9T
6791
<reT
S6'ST

€LE
CLE
TLE
0LE
69E
B9g
£9¢
99g -
S9€E
¥oe
£9¢€
Z9g
19t
0s&
65t
8SE

LSE

9gg
SSE
¥5g
£SE
45
1€
0SE
343
8YE
Lve
9ve
SPE



69'v9Z
[A 44T
ST'vSe
88'ESC
T8°e9¢
YE'EST
LO'ESC
08'cot
£5°29T
92'e9T
66'19¢C
¢L'18e
St'19¢
BT'T9¢
T6°09¢
¥8'09¢
L2092
0T'09c
£8°65¢
95°65¢C
6¢°65T
[ASNC} T4
SL°86T
BF'8SC
1¢'85¢2
¥6'LST
AW AT
o) A4
ET°L5C
98'95¢
65'95¢
[43:1°14

LT'E9T
06'29T
£9°791
9€"Z9T
60"29T
8’191
S9°T9T
87191
TO 19T
¥L09T
L5091
0Z°09T
£6°69T
99651
6E'6ST
[A4 %3
S8'85T
85°89T
TE'8ST
¥0'8ST
LLLST
05°ZS5T
ET'LST
96'99T
69°95T
ZF'9sT
ST'9ST
88°5ST
T9'59T
PE'SST
LO'SST
08°¥ST
€5°PST
9TvsT
66291

€l6
[#4]
Ti6
0iB
696
896
£96
996
596
96
€96
96
196
096
656
BS6
£56
946
5596
&)
£96
€56
TS6
056
6¥6
8t6
LY6
are
Sr6
¥r6
£€v6
re
Tv6
or6

B80¥
L0
950t
SO¥
Por
£0v
wor
TOF
00F.
66€
86€ -
LBE
96¢
SBE
¥6E
EGE
(43
T6E
06E
68€
88¢
8%
98t
<8e
¥3E
£8€
[4:13
18t
01:3
6LE
8/E
LLE
9LE
St

FLE



TLTLZ
' ILT
LTTLT
06'0LT
£9°0/2
9g70LT
60°0LT

€8'65¢C -

55'69¢C
- 8BT'697
T0'69¢T
¥L°89T
£'89¢
V118
€6°'/9¢C
99'£9¢
6E'/92
[4A:T4
58997
85°99¢
1€'99¢
0957
LL799T
08'59¢
£T°592
96°¥9Z

LY "ON ‘0707

6T°0LT

€6'69T
59'691
8E'69T

IT'e9T
8891
L59°891
0OE'89T

€0°89T

94'L9T
6¥'L9T
ZCLaT
56991
899971

T¥'991
Y1997
£8'997
09591
££°99T
90°S9T

6L'F9T
(AR o)
STP9T
86'E9T
TL€9T
TEST
X

JOIWPUIWY (S[enpral

PUJ 10 Uonpupa( plepuelg) Xe ], awoduy



6¥'LEC
eeLee
56'97T
89°97¢
Tr'otT
v1'9¢z
L8972
0g'gez
EEaCe
80°9¢C
6L7CT
(A it
STYET
86°E2T
TLETe
L2 AT44
LT'EZL
06'7¢Z
£9'tee
9g'¢ee
60°¢Zc
[4:was
SS'TEC

£ect
[A=14%
TECT
0EZT
6C¢Ct
87T
LZZT
9ZTT
STCT
(44"
EZeT
[£44"
TZ2T
0Z7T
6IZT
8Tt
LT2T
91¢1
STZT
14T4"
£t
[414>

S50°£ET
8L'9CT
18971
{4
LB'SZT
0L'SZT
[ARTAN
arsit
68°¥ZT
[4=h 74"
SEVTT
80°¥CT
Tg'eCT
PeETT
LT'erT
00'tCT
£LTTT
=) A
6T°CCT
[4°mr4>
S9'1¢t
8T
LA

098
698
898
LG8
958
548
¥s8
£58
758
168
0S8
618
8r8
Ly8
Sv8
sve
+¥8
EVE
[4 41
8
ov3
628

1207 ATenuep | uo4y o[npovyds FAVA

PaIMIYSqus Vg S[poyog
T 2npaydg

L8

LT "ON “0T0T JURWPUIWY (S[enPIAIPU] J0J UONINP3(] PAEPUEIS) XE L, amoduy



¥6'9€e
£9'9E¢C
Ot'9ET
E1'9EZ
98'ste
69°SEL
CE'SET
SO'SET
BLYPET
TSVET
{444
LB'ELT
DL'EET
EV'EET
oT'eeT
68'CET
cozee
SE'TEC
80°Cez
IBTEC
¥S1ET
LTI
00°TET
EL0ET
9t'0ET
6T'0ET
26622
S9°6¢2
8E62C
Tt6ece
¥8'8¢Z
£5°8¢¢
0egzz
e0'8te
9L'LTT

LT "ON ‘0Z0z

05'9eT
ET9ET
96'SET
69°SET
CV'SET
ST'SET
88'VET
TIPET

FeE'vET
LO'pET
OB'EET
ES'EET
9Z'tET
66'CET

CLTET
SPCET
8T'ZET
TO'IET
¥o'TCT
LE'TET
0T'TET
EB'0LT
SS'0ET
GZ°0ET
Z0'0eT
SL'6CT
8¥'6CT
26Tt
14°%:14"
£L9°8¢T

Or'8TT
E1'8Z1
98° /2T
65421
cELeT

JUAWPUIWY (SENPIAIPYU] JOJ UOHINPI piEpue)g) Xeuy, suwoouy

0

I




Il

6E 9T
Z19%¢
Sg'ste
85'Ste
Te'SPT
¥o'sbe
LLYYE
0S¥
ETYPT
9&6'eve
69EVT
TVEYT
STEVE
88re
T9°Zhe
AL
LO'TYVE
0B'I¥Z
£9'THC
9TV
66°0tC
ZLave
St'ove
8T'0FT
16'9EC
¥9'6ET
LEGET
4] 11
£8'8€ET
95°8EC
67°BET
CO'8EL
SLLET
BY'LEC
TTLET

20T
COET
TOET
00ET
66¢T
8621
L6821
96¢T
secl
T4
€671
(448
T6ZT
0sctT
68T
88tT
L8¢T
98¢T
5871
114"
£8¢T
[4:1 4
8T
0871
6/CT
BLTT
LLTT
9471
SLTT
vLCT
ELZT
[4XA"
TLZT
0LZT

LT "ON 0207

S6'SPT
89'stT
TSI
PTSPT
LB'FFT
09'+¥1
EEFPT
S0'+PT
6/ YT
CE'EPT
SUEVT
86°CHT
TLTPT
vt
LTTYT
06'T¥T
€9'TPT
SETYT
60'THr1
[4:30; 4¢
SSORT
gz'ort
TOO¥T
VL'6ET
LY'BET
0T'6ET
£6'BET
99°8€T
6E'BET
CT'8ET
S8LET
8G°LET
TE'LET
VOLET
LLOET

~ JIRWPUIWY (S[BNPIAIPU] J0J UONINPI( PICPUE)S) XBT IW0I]




4!

¥8'55T € Ot"SST
L5557 ] £1'SST
0€°85T _ _ 98'¥ST
£0°SST , 65YST
9/'%5T 70 TEPVST
6¥'¥52 SO'vST
T HSe ) SL°EST
$6°EST L0 TSEST
89'€5C ) S PZ'esT
THEST , L6TST
AN T 0T8T
187257 19'20¢ €1°ZST
09'25¢ 120 aT'zZsT
£€'75T 68°TST
90'¢st ! 3 Z9TST
6LTST &6 T0¢ _ SET1ST
7SIST 80'TST
ST'IST 18°0ST
86°05Z ; #5'06T
T.°0S2 €€ LT0ST
¥rosz 00°0ST
1108z £L66T
06°6%C ot 6YT
go6rz 61671
9E'6HT [ 7681
60°6¥T SO8YT
78°'8PT ) 88T
o d , TT89T
gT'8YT EA A
08Pz _ _ LS IbT
vLive _ 0g"Z¥T
LY VT . EQ YT
0T Lve I4 5.°9¥T
£6°9%Z ) . 67 9¥T
99'9b7 ‘ o

LT "oN ‘0z0z JUSWIPUIWIY (S[ENPIAIPU] 10] UOPINPI(] PIEPUE)S) XE, 3woduy :



£l

mw.mmm mhmﬂ g It
s by 85491
G/ H97 TLET TEFOT
orve ozt YO'YaT
B eoe1 LL°€9T
oAt o6t 05°€9T
s JoeT £2°€9T
ol o 96791
et P 69291
ok ooeT TH'Z9T
ol cost 51791
7579z 2951 8819l
0792 TogT 1997
s Jetd PEToT
T 1oz 65ET L0'T9T
akids soer 08°091
s e £6°09T
62097 o5eT 5z'09T
boodd ceer 66'65T
9109z veeT 2L68T
s ccer SI6ST
29652 861 8T'65T
o tee 16'95T
" oot 98T
Boese P LE°85T
e ore 0T'85T
s oo £8'5T
il ool 96T
byl el 62451
srest oo 20'5T
plepis EPET $1°95T
o ool 8°55T
$9'057 TvET 1295t
- OvET Y6'SST
ild L9°5ST

. NH ._._o.%‘ﬁo_wcn.. [1uampuaUrY (S[ENPIAIPU] J0f UONINpaq pavpue)s) xel awmodny - -



14!

0C0T—3usurelIeg SPUB(S] 0O SY) Jo AJLOYINE S1Y) JOpun pajurig
JUSMIATLUEA SIUIOUO0T PUE S0UBUL] JO ARSIUTAF—UOISIAL(T JUSUILSRURIA STUASY oY) Aq passjsturpe st 10y Sy

05142 96ET _ 90'TLT
€TTLT SGET 6L°0LT
967042 PEET 78041
69042 £6ET SZT'0LT
ZroLe Z6ET 867691
ST°04Z T6ET T£'69T
83'652 0BET ‘ 69T
19'69Z 68ET _ LT'69T
vE'692 88¢T , 06'891
L0°69T L8ET . £9°89T
08'892 98eT . 9£'89T
£6°897 S8ET 50'89T
97'89¢ ¥BET [ A )
66°L9T = £8€T S5°/9T
z119e ZUET 8T'L9T
Sb'£9Z T8ET 5T 10°£9T
81°29Z 0B€T - v1'991T
16'99% 6LET L5991
¥9°99z 8LET 0Z'99T
££'99Z LLET £6'59T
01°99% 9/ET 99'G9T
£8'597 SLET 6E'59T

95°59¢ vLET €159t

(3USWPUIMY (S[BNPIAIPU] J0f WONINPI(] PABPUR)S) XL, amodty



