
43

TO AMEND THE AIRPORT DEPARTURE TAX ACT 1986

ENACTED by the Parliament of the Republic of Fiji—

Short title and commencement
1.—(1) This Act may be cited as the Airport Departure Tax (Budget Amendment) 

Act 2024.

(2) This Act comes into force on 1 August 2024.  

(3) In this Act, the Airport Departure Tax Act 1986 is referred to as the “Principal Act”.
Section 3 amended

 2. Section 3 of the Principal Act is amended by—

(a) in paragraph (a), deleting “$125 from 1 August 2023” and substituting 
“$170 from 1 August 2024”; and

(b) in paragraph (b), deleting “$140 from 1 January 2024” and substituting 
“$200 from 1 August 2025”.

Section 5 amended
 3. Section 5(b) of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “96” and substituting “48”.

Passed by the Parliament of the Republic of Fiji this 12th day of July 2024.

ACT NO. 10 OF 2024

I assent.

W. M. KATONIVERE
 President

[12 July 2024]

AN ACT

Price: 24c                                                   STAR PRINTERY PTE LTD, (Government Printer), Suva, Fiji – 2024                                                       10/Z/24—170
Official Printer Since 2022


