
209

[Legal Notice No. 90]
CUSTOMS ACT 1986
(ACT NO. 11 OF 1986)

________

Customs (Amendment) (No. 2) Regulations 2015
IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 191 of the Customs Act 1986, I 
hereby make these Regulations—

Short title and commencement
1.—(1) T hese Regulations may be cited as the Customs (Amendment) (No. 2) 

Regulations 2015.

(2) T hese Regulations shall come into force on 6 November 2015.

(3) I n these Regulations, the Customs Regulations 1986 shall be referred to as the 
“Principal Regulations”.

Regulation 95 amended
2.  Regulation 95 of the Principal Regulations is amended in subsection (1) by deleting 

“3 months” and substituting “12 months”.

Regulation 153 amended
3.  Regulation 153 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$2” and 

substituting “$10”.

Made this 6th day of November 2015.

A. SAYED-KHAIYUM
Attorney-General and Minister for Finance

Price: 70c	 S. NAVUNILAWA, Government Printer, Suva, Fiji – 2015	 113/FGGS/15—900	
Official Printer Since 1883


