
201

[LEGAL NOTICE NO. 76]

EMPLOYMENT RELATIONS ACT 2007
________

Wages (Manufacturing Industry) (Amendment) 

Regulations 2017

IN exercise of the powers conferred on me by section 264 of the Employment Relations 

Act 2007 and acting on the advice of the Employment Relations Advisory Board, I hereby 

make these Regulations—

Short title and commencement

1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Wages (Manufacturing Industry) 

(Amendment) Regulations 2017.

(2) These Regulations come into force on 30 September 2017.

(3) In these Regulations, the Wages (Manufacturing Industry) Regulations 2015 is 

referred to as the “Principal Regulations”.

Regulation 2 amended

2. Regulation 2 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$250” and 

substituting “$300”. 

Regulation 4 amended

3. Regulation 4 of the Principal Regulations is amended by—

(a) 

(b) in subregulation (2), deleting “$3.94” and substituting “$4.10”. 

Regulation 6 amended

4. Regulation 6(1)(b) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “regulation 8” 

and substituting “these Regulations, 8 hours for 6 days work or 9 hours for 5 days work”.

Regulation 8 amended

5. Regulation 8(2) of the Principal Regulations is amended after “each week” by 

substituting “, and a worker who is required to work for 6 days a week is required to get 

an additional rest day”.

 Regulation 9 amended

6. Regulation 9 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “twice” wherever 

it appears and substituting “double”.

Regulation 10 amended

7. Regulation 10 of the Principal Regulations is amended after subregulation (1) by 

inserting the following new subregulation—

  “(1A) The sick leave entitlement under these Regulations is different from the 

sick leave entitlement under the Workmen’s Compensation Act 1964.”.



202

Regulation 11 amended

8. Regulation 11 of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “in excess of 2 

hours” and substituting “for 2 hours or more”.

Made this 31st day of August 2017.

J. USAMATE

Minister for Employment, 

Productivity and Industrial Relations

[LEGAL NOTICE NO. 77]

EMPLOYMENT RELATIONS ACT 2007
________

Wages (Mining and Quarrying) (Amendment) 

Regulations 2017

IN exercise of the powers conferred on me by section 264 of the Employment Relations 

Act 2007 and acting on the advice of the Employment Relations Advisory Board, I hereby 

make these Regulations—

Short title and commencement

1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Wages (Mining and Quarrying) 

(Amendment) Regulations 2017.

(2) These Regulations come into force on 30 September 2017.

(3) In these Regulations, the Wages (Mining and Quarrying) Regulations 2015 is referred 

to as the “Principal Regulations”.

Regulation 3 amended

2. Regulation 3 of the Principal Regulations is amended by—

(a) 

(b) 

(c) 

(d) 

““year” means a period commencing on a date in a calendar year and 

expiring on the date preceding the corresponding date in the following 

calendar year.”.


