
370 

[Legal Notice NO. 96) 
CIVIL AVIATION ACT 1986 

(No.7 of 1978) 

AIR NAVIGATION (FEES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 
1995 

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 6(2) of the Civil 
Aviation Act, 1986, the Minister hereby makes the following 
Regulations -

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Air Navigation (Fees) 
(Amendment) Regulations 1995. 

2. The Schedule to the Air Navigation (Fees) (Amendment) 
Regulations 1987· is hereby amended as follows -

(a) In paragraph 1(1)(a) by deleting the amounts "$25.00" 
and "$40.00" that appears therein and substituting 
therefor "$50.00" and "$50.00" respectively; 

(b) In paragraph 1(1)(b) by deleting the words "$3.50 per 
500 kg" and substituting therefor "$10.00 per 1,000 kg"; 

(c) In paragraph I(I)(c) by deleting the words "$4.90 per 500 
kg" and substituting therefor "$15.00 for 1,000 kg"; 

(d) In paragraph 1(1)(d) by deleting the words "$6.90 per 
500 kg" and substituting therefor "$20.00 per 1,000 kg"; 

(e) In paragraph 1(1)(e) by deleting the words "10.00 per 500 
kg" and substituting therefor "$30.00 per 1,000 kg"; 

(f) In paragraph 1(5), by deleting sub-paragraphs (a), (b), 
(c) and (d) and substituting therefor the following new 
paragraphs -

" (a) aircraft being used for a Government 
ceremonial purpose; 

(b) aircraft being used to calibrate navigational aids 
in Solomon Islands; 

(c) aircraft engaged in search and rescue flights; 
(d) aircraft for which a written application for such 

exemption has been made to and granted by 
the Minister."; 



 

    
        

     
 

        
      

  

         

  
      

    

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 
 

  

 

 
 

 

 




