[Legal Notice No. 2]

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) ACT
(Cap. 84)
THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (PUISNE JUDGE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2004

. IN exercise of the powers conferred by ‘'section 3 of the Constitutional Offices

(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Prime Minister hereby makes the
following regulations -

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices
(Termss and Conditions of Service) (Puisne Judge) (Amendment) Regulations
2004.

2. The Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service)
(Puisne Judge) Regulations* is hereby amended in the following
respects - ‘




3

(a) in regulation 4, by deleting the figure “$60,948.90” and
substituting therefor the figure “$85,000.00”;

(b) mn regulation 7, by inserting a comma immediately after
the word “gas” and adding the word “telephone” thereafter, and

(c) in regulation 15, by deleting the figure “$40.00” and
substituting therefor the figure “$210.00.”

Dated at Honiara this thirty-first day of December, 2004.

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA
Prime Minister

*L.N. 142/1990 (Cap.84,p.2595)






