25

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT

(Cap. 84)

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS

OF SERVICE) (CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS
2006



26

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES
(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT
(Cap. 84)

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) ( CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 2006

ARRANGEMENT OF REGULATIONS

REGULATION:

L. CITATION

2. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 4
3. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 6
4. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 7
5. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 9
6. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 14
7. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 15
8. AMENDMENT OF REGULATION 16

9. INSERTION OF NEW REGULATION 24



THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2006

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Constitutional Offices

27

THE CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES

(TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT

(Cap. 84)

(Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, the Minister hereby makes the following

regulations -

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Constitutional Offices (Terms
and Conditions of Service) (Chief Justice)(Amendment) Regulations
2006, and shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from

Ist January, 2006.

2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions of
Service) (Chief Justice) Regulations (hereinafter referred to as the
“principal Regulations™) is hereby amended by deleting the words
“salary of $110,00.00”and substituting therefor the words“fortnightly

salary of $5,000.00”.

3. Regulation 6 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by
deleting the full stop at the end of the sentence and substituting

therefor the words “‘or in the absence of a rent free accommodation
and at the option of the officer, he shall receive a housing allowance

of $5,000.00 per month.”

4. Regulation 7 of the principal Regulation is hereby amended by
deleting the full stop at the end of the sentence and substituting

herefor the

following “or at the option of the officer, he shall receive a utilities

allowance of $1,300.00 per month.”

Amendment

5.

Regulation 9 of the principal Regulation is hereby

Citation

Amendment
of regulation
4

Amendment
of regulation
6

Amendment
of regulation
7



of regulation
9

Amendment
of regulation
14

Amendment
of regulation
15

Amendment
of regulation
16

Insertion
of
new

regulation 24

28

amended by deleting the full stop at the end of the
sentence and substituting therefor the following
words “and shall also receive a fuel allowance of
$500.00 per month.

6.  Regulations 14 of the principal Regulation is here by
amended by deleting the figure “$210.00” and
substituting therefor the figure “$250.00”.

7. Regulation 15 of the principal Regulation is hereby
amended by deleting the figure “$4,000.00” and
substituting therefor the figure “$10,000.00”.

8. Regulation 16 of the principal Regulation is hereby
deleted and the following substituted therefor -

“Clothing 16. The Chief Justice shall be paid a

allowance clothing allowance of $10,000.00
per annum.”
9. The principal Regulation is hereby amended by

inserting immediately after regulation 23 a new
regulation 24 as follows -

“Education 24. The Chief Justice shall receive an
grant education grant of $5,000.00 per
annum.”

Made at Honiara this thirtieth day of January 2006

SIR ALLAN KEMAKEZA
Prime Minister



