
title 

lencement 

dment of 
ation 9 

dment of 
ation IlC 

43 

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette 

Monday 1 st April, 2013 

[Legal Notice No. 30] 

CONSTITUTION OF THE SOLOMON ISLANDS 
(Schedule to LN 43 of 1978) 

S.I. No.l5 

MEMBERS OF PARLIAMENT (ENTITLEMENTS) 
COMMISSION (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2013 

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon it by section 69B (2) and 137(1) of the 
Constitution, the Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Commission makes the 
following regulations -

1. (1) These Regulations may be cited as the Members of Parliament 
(Entitlements) Commission (Amendment) Regulations 2013 and commences on the 1st 
April 2013. . 

2. The Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Regulations ("principal reg-
ulation") is amended by deleting the words "one hundred and fifty thousand and substi­
tuting the words three hundred thousand". 

3. Regulation IIC of the principal regulation is amended by deleting the 
"Table" that appear therein and substituting instead the following new Table. 

Table 

Aggregate period of years Percentage of salary for life pension 
served in Parliament 

Column (I) (Column (2) 

Up to 8 years 30% 

Up to 16 years 40% 

Up to 20 years 50% 

Up to 24 years 75% 

Above 24 years 85% 



Amendment of 
regulation 17 

4. 

44 

Regulation 17 of the principal regulation is amended -

(a) by adding at the end of subregulation (I) the following 
words "The education grant shall be paid directly to the 
member of Parliament"; and 

(b) by deleting subregulations (2) and (3) respectively. 

Amendment of 5. Regulation 42 (8) of the principal regulation is amended by 
Regulation 42 deleting the figure "$4000" and substituting the figure "$4500". 

Amendment of 
Appendix A 

6. Appendix A of the principal regulation is amended -

(a) In Column 8 by deleting the figures and words that 
appear in respect of the posts specified therein and 
substituting the following figures and words 

"USD 400 per day 
USD 350 per day 
USD 300 per day; and 

(b) In Column 9 by deleting the figure "$100,000" and 
substituting the figure "$400,000". 

Dated at Honiara thihs first day of April, 2013. 

CHAIRMAN 
Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Commission 

Honiara, Solomon Islands 
Printed under the authority of the 

Solomon Islands Govel11ment 

Printed by Public Service Commission. 


