
186 

[Legal Notice No. 64] 
PROVINCIAL GOVERNMENT ACT 

(No.7 of 1981) 

THE PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLIES ELECTION (AMENDMENT) 
REGULATIONS 1993 

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 12 of the Provincial 
Government Act, 1981, the Minister of Provincial Government 
hereby makes the following Regulations -

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Provincial Assemblies 
Election (Amendment) Regulations 1993. 

2. Regulation 12 of the Provincial Assemblies Election 
Regulations 1986 (hereinafter referred to as the "principal 
Regulations") is hereby amended in the following respects -

(a) by deleting the words "one hundred" that appear in sub­
regulation (1) and substitute instead the words "two 
hundred and fifty"; 

(b) by deleting paragraph (c) of regulation (3). 

3. Sub-regulation (3) of regulation 32 of the principal Regulations 
is hereby amended by deleting the words "five hundred" and 
substitute instead the words "one thousand". 

Dated at Honiara this eleventh day of March, 1993. 

A. QURUSU 
Minister of Provincial Government 


