6l

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette

20th September 2007 S.I. No. 51

{Legal Notice 162]

SOLOMON ISLANDS INDEPENDENCE ORDER 1978
(L.N. No. 43 of 1978)

THE MEMBERS OF PARLIAMENT (ENTITLEMENT) COMMISSION

(AMENDMENT) REGULATION 2007

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 69B(2) of the Constitution, the
Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Commission hereby makes the following
regulations -

Citation
Commencement

Insertion of
Regulation 10D

Amendment of
Appendix A5

Amendment of
regulation
Y3NbX)

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Members of

Parliament (Entitlements) Commission (Amendment) Regulation
2007 and shall be deemed to have come into operation on the st day of April
2007.

2. The principal regulation is hereby amended by inserting
immediately after regulation 10C the following new regulation as regulation
10D as follows -

“Local 10D. All ordinary members of Parliament who

subsistence travel into Honiara from their Constituencies to

allowance to attend a sitting of Parliament shall be paid a
local Subsistence allowance at a rate of $250.00
per day.”

3. Appendix A5 of the principal regulation is hereby

amended by deleting the same and substituting therefore the following
new Appendix AS as follows -

“APPENDIX A5 Zone 1 $16,000
Zone 2 $15,800
Zone 3 $15,600
Zone 4 $15,400
Zone 5 $12,200”
4. Regulation 9(3)b(1) of the principal regulation is hereby

amended by deleting the words “seventy five thousand dollars” and
inserting therefore the words “eighty thousand dollars”.



Amendment of
regulation 16(2)

Amendment of
regulation 50(3)

Amendment of
regulation 31(1)

Amendment of
regulation 31(3)

Amendment of

regulation 39(7)

Amendment of

regulation 39(8)

Amendment of
regulation 40(2)

Amendment of
regulation 67

\V

162

5. Regulation 16(2) of the principal regulation is here-
by amended by inserting immediately after the word “touring” the
words “overseas or”.

6. Regulation 50(3) of the principal regulation is here-
by amended by deleting the words ““one-fifth of”” and inserting
immediately after the word ““the” the word “full”.

7. Regulation 31(1) of the principal regulation is here-
by amended by deleting the figures “$5,000” and $10,000” that
appear therein and substituting figures “$9,000” and $15,000”
respectively.

8. Regulation 31(3) of the principal regulation is
amended by inserting immediately after the word “employ” the
words “one security guard”.

9. Regulation 31(3) of the principal regulation is here-
by amended by deleting the figure “$3,000” and $4,000.

10. Regulation 39(8) of the principal regulation is here-
by amended by deleting the figure “$1,500” and inserting the figure
$2,000”.

11. Regulation 40(2) of the principal regulation is here-
by amended by deleting the figures “$4,000” and inserting the fig-
ure $2,000” and inserting instead the figures “$6,000” and $3,000”
respectively

12. Regulation 67 of the principal regulation is hereby
amended by deleting the words “three to four” and inserting the
word “eight” .

Dated at Honiara this first day of April 2007

COLLIN R. DARCY

Chairman
Members of Parliament (Entitiements) Commission



