87

S U PP LEM EN T to the Solomon Islands Gazette

Wednesday 14th July, 2004 S.1. No.30

[Legal Notice No. 84]

SOLOMON ISLANDS INDEPENDENCE ORDER 1978
(L.N. No. 43 of 1978)

" MEMBERS OF PARLIAMENT (ENTITLEMENTS) COMMISSION |
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2004

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 69B(2) of the Constitution, the
Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Commission hereby makes the following
regulations -

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Members of Parliament
(Entitlements) Commission (Amendment) Regulations 2004, and shall be deemed
to have come into force on the 1st day of April 2004.

2. Regulation 9(3)(b) of the principal Regulaﬁons* is hereby
amended by deleting the word “fifty” thereof and substituting therefore the word
“seventy-five”.

3. Regulation 12(1) of the principal Regulation is hereby amended
by deleting the figure $15,000” thereof and substituting therefor the figure
“$50’0mn. .

4. Regulation 39 of the principal Regulations is hereby amended by
inserting immediately after regulation 39(8) the following new subregulations as
follows - :

« €)) A transport allowance of $2,500 per month shall be paid
to Ministers and the Leader of Opposition,

: (10)  Persons holding and garaging Government vehicles shall
be paid a fuel allowance of $300 per month,” '

5. Regulation 40(2) of the principal Regulations is hereby amended
by deleting the figures “$1,000” and “$500” thereof and substituting therefor the
figures ““$2,000” and “$1000” respectively.




88

6. Part VII of the principal Regulations is hereby amended by
inserting immediately after regulation 64 the following new regulation as
regulation 64A as follows -

“ 64A. The Members of Parliament shall be entitled to an
Insurance Scheme as set out in Appendix D of these Regulations,”

7. Regulation 68(1) of the principal Regulations is hereby amended
by deleting the figure “$300” thereof and substituting therefor the figure “$800”.

8. Regulation 68(2) of the principal Regulations is hereby amended
by deleting the figure “$600” thereof and substituting therefor the figure “$800”

4 - 9. Appendix A of the principal Regulations is hereby amended by
deleting item 1:, BASIC SALARY”, item ‘2, APPOINTMENT GRANT”, and
item “4. CONSTITUENCY ALLOWANCE?” thereof and substituting therefor the
following respectively -

“ L BASIC SALARY

The following taxable salaries will be paid -

Prime Minister $80,000 per annum
Deputy Prime Minister $65,000 per annum
Ministers and Leader

of the Opposition : $60,000 per annum
The Leader of the Independent $52,000 per ann

Members '

Deputy Speaker
Members $50,000 per annum

2. APPOINTMENT GRANT [Reg. 15]
Members $5,000
Prime Minister, Deputy

of the Opposition shall in
addition receive $1,000




89
CONSTITUENCY ALLOWANCE [Reg. 9(2)]

Zone 1 | $7,000

TEMOTU PELE
TEMOTU NENDE
VATUD
MALAITA OUTER ISLANDS

Zone 2 $6,800

EAST ARE ARE

WEST ARE ARE

SMALL MALAITA

WEST MAKIRA
CENTRAL MAKIRA
EAST MAKIRA

SOUTH CHOISEUL
NORTH EAST CHOISEUL
EAST CHOISEUL
ULAWA AND UGI
SHORTLANDS

RENNELL AND BELLONA

Zone 3 $6,600

NORTH VELLA LA VELLA

SOUTH VELLA LA VELLA

RANONGA AND SIMBO

NORTH NEW GEORGIA

SOUTH NEW GEORGIA, RENDOVA
- & TETEPARI

MAROVO

HOGRANO/KIA/HAVULEI

MARINGE/KOKOTA

GAO/BUGOTU

EAST KWAIO

WEST KWAIO

NGELLA

SAVO AND RUSSELLS

SOUTH GUADALCANAL




90
Zone 4 $6,400

GIZO AND KOLOMBANGARA
WEST NEW GEORGIA

AND VONAVONA
NORTHEAST MALAITA -
EAST MALAITA
LAU/MBAELELEA
FATALEKA
CENTRAL KWARA'AE
‘WEST KWARA'AE
AOKE/LANGALANGA
NORTHEAST GUADALCANAL
WEST GUADALCANAL
EAST GUADALCANAL
CENTRAL GUADALCANAL
NORTH GUADALCANAL
BAEGU ASIFOLAE

Zone 5 $5,200
WEST HONIARA
EAST HONIARA
CENTRAL HONIARA
10. APPENDIX D [Reg. 64A]
UOTATION SLIP

MEMBERS OF PARLIAMENT GROUP LIFE AND MEDICAL POLICY

Proposer : SOLOMONS MUTUAL INSURANCE LIMITED
Attention : Hon. FRED FONO
CHAIRMAN IN HOUSE
Assured : Covering 50 members of Parliament not exceeding the
age of 60 years. '

Issue Date : TBA

Commencement Date: TBA




9]
Period of Cover : 12 months from date to be confirmed

Policy Wording  : Standard SMI Group Life and Medical Policy
Type of Cover Section 1 - Covering Group Loss of
Life with Total and
Permanent Disability due
to Natural Causes.
Section II - Covering Group Loss of
Life with Total and
Permanent Disability due to
Accident.
Section III - Covering Group Healtl/
Medical, Overseas
Repatriation and Funeral
Expenses.
Section Type Sum Assured | Annual Premium
per Member
I Group Loss of Life with Total
and Permanent Disability $100,000.00 $900.00
(Natural Cause) Policy :
Group Personal Accident '
i with Total and Pecmanent $100,000.00
Disability (Accident Cause)
Policy
M) | Group Health - Medicare $20,000.00
®) | Group Emergency iati $ 30,000.00 $3,000.00
(©) | Funeral Expenses $ 5,000.00
{ | Total Premium Per Member | 1 $3.900.00

Dated at Honiara this fourteenth day of July, 2004.

COLIN R. DARCY
Chairman
Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Commission

L.N. No. 59/2000.




Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the
Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Solomon Islands Printers Ltd.




