6l

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette

20th September 2007 S.I. No. 51

{Legal Notice 162]

SOLOMON ISLANDS INDEPENDENCE ORDER 1978
(L.N. No. 43 of 1978)

THE MEMBERS OF PARLIAMENT (ENTITLEMENT) COMMISSION

(AMENDMENT) REGULATION 2007

IN exercise of the powers conferred by section 69B(2) of the Constitution, the
Members of Parliament (Entitlements) Commission hereby makes the following
regulations -

Citation
Commencement

Insertion of
Regulation 10D

Amendment of
Appendix A5

Amendment of
regulation
Y3NbX)

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Members of

Parliament (Entitlements) Commission (Amendment) Regulation
2007 and shall be deemed to have come into operation on the st day of April
2007.

2. The principal regulation is hereby amended by inserting
immediately after regulation 10C the following new regulation as regulation
10D as follows -

“Local 10D. All ordinary members of Parliament who

subsistence travel into Honiara from their Constituencies to

allowance to attend a sitting of Parliament shall be paid a
local Subsistence allowance at a rate of $250.00
per day.”

3. Appendix A5 of the principal regulation is hereby

amended by deleting the same and substituting therefore the following
new Appendix AS as follows -

“APPENDIX A5 Zone 1 $16,000
Zone 2 $15,800
Zone 3 $15,600
Zone 4 $15,400
Zone 5 $12,200”
4. Regulation 9(3)b(1) of the principal regulation is hereby

amended by deleting the words “seventy five thousand dollars” and
inserting therefore the words “eighty thousand dollars”.



Amendment of
regulation 16(2)

Amendment of
regulation 50(3)

Amendment of
regulation 31(1)

Amendment of
regulation 31(3)

Amendment of

regulation 39(7)

Amendment of

regulation 39(8)

Amendment of
regulation 40(2)

Amendment of
regulation 67

\V

162

5. Regulation 16(2) of the principal regulation is here-
by amended by inserting immediately after the word “touring” the
words “overseas or”.

6. Regulation 50(3) of the principal regulation is here-
by amended by deleting the words ““one-fifth of”” and inserting
immediately after the word ““the” the word “full”.

7. Regulation 31(1) of the principal regulation is here-
by amended by deleting the figures “$5,000” and $10,000” that
appear therein and substituting figures “$9,000” and $15,000”
respectively.

8. Regulation 31(3) of the principal regulation is
amended by inserting immediately after the word “employ” the
words “one security guard”.

9. Regulation 31(3) of the principal regulation is here-
by amended by deleting the figure “$3,000” and $4,000.

10. Regulation 39(8) of the principal regulation is here-
by amended by deleting the figure “$1,500” and inserting the figure
$2,000”.

11. Regulation 40(2) of the principal regulation is here-
by amended by deleting the figures “$4,000” and inserting the fig-
ure $2,000” and inserting instead the figures “$6,000” and $3,000”
respectively

12. Regulation 67 of the principal regulation is hereby
amended by deleting the words “three to four” and inserting the
word “eight” .

Dated at Honiara this first day of April 2007

COLLIN R. DARCY

Chairman
Members of Parliament (Entitiements) Commission



163
[Legal Notice No. 163]

COMMISSIONS OF INQUIRY ACT
(Cap. 5)

COMMISSION OF INQUIRY INTO THE APRIL 2006 CIVIL UNREST IN HONIARA
AMENDMENT OF COMMISSION
BY The Honourable Manasseh D Sogavare MP, Prime Minister of Solomon Islands

TO: MR BRIAN DANESBURY BRUNTON of Alotau, Papua New Guinea;
MR WAETA BEN TABUSAST SIM CSI of Honiara, Solomon Islands;
MR NOEL LEVI CBE of Kavieng, Papua New Guinea; and
MR CHARLES LEVO of Honiara, Solomon Islands

WHEREAS by virtue of the commission* issued on April 24, 2007 Messrs Brian
Danesbury Brunton; Waeta Ben Tabusasi SIM CSI; Noel Levi CBE and Charles Levo
were duly appointed as commissioners (“the Commissioners”) to inquire into the
civil unrest which occurred in Honiara during the period between April 18, 2006 and
April 20, 2006, following the election of The Honourable Snyder Rini MP as Prime
Minister of Solomon Islands (“the April 2006 Civil Unrest”) and directed, pursuant to
paragraph 3(e) thereof, to submit their written report on the result of their inquiry to
the Prime Minister within five months of the commencement of the inquiry.

AND WHEREAS the Prime Minister has considered it advisable to extend the dura-

tion of the inquiry by another two months to enable the Commissioners to complete
their inquiry

NOW THEREFORE in exercise of the powers conferred upon the Prime Minster by
Section 4(1) of the Commissions of Inquiry Act (Cap. 5) and pursuant to paragraph
3(e) of the commission*, I, The Honourable Manasseh D Sogavare MP, Prime

Minister hereby amend paragraph 3(e) of the commission* by replacing the word
“five” with the word “seven”

DATED at Honiara this 31st day of August, 2007.

THE HONOURABLE MANASSEH D SOGAVARE MP
Prime Minister

*L.N. No. 141/07 p. 282



Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the
Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Solomon Islands Printers Ltd.



