S U P P LEM EIVT to the Solomon Islands Gazette

Wednesday 7" January, 2009 S.I. Ne. 1

{Legal Notice No. 1]

PRICE CONTROL ACT
(Cap. 64)

THE PRICE CONTROL (APPLICATION TO GOODS AND
RESTRICTION OF PRICES) (AMENDMENT) (NO.14) ORDER 2008,

IN exercise of the powers conferred by sections 4 and 6 of the Price Contro} Act,
and after consultations with the Prices Advisory Committee, I, FRANCIS BILLY
HILLY, Minister of Commerce, Employment and Industries, do hereby make the
foliowing Order -

L. This Order may be cited as the Price Contro! (Application to Goods and
Restriction of Prices) (Amendment) (No.14) Order 2008 and shall come
into operation on 1 January 2009.

to

Schedule 3 to the Price Control (Application to Goods and Restriction of
Prices) Order 1987* is hereby amended by deleting serial No.13 thereof
and substituting therefor the following —

“13 PETROLEUM PRODUCTS

WHOLESALE RETAIL
(maximum price in (maximum price in
cents per litre) cents per litre)

{a) Petroleum Motor Spirit
- (PMS) 522.56 660.9

(b) Distillate - (ADO) 620.08 773.1
(c) Kerosene - (KERO) 656.21 (maximum percentage
mark-up)

-cost into store plus 15%
for sales of packaged
product

-cost mnto store plus 20%
for break-bulk sales.”

Dated at Honiara this twentieth-fourth day of December, 2008.

FRANCIS BILLY HILLY
Minister of Commerce, Employment and Industries

*LN.No47/87 p.104




{L.egal Notice No. 2]

HONIARA CITY ACT 1999
(No.2 of 1999)

The Honiara City Council
2009 Rates and Charges Amendment Ordinance

AN ORDINANCE
TO

Amend those specific fees, rates and charges so listed in the Honiara City Counci] |
gg}y-ﬁaws ?%the amounts prescribed in the Schedules for theé 2009 Tinaricial year'
ad 16 alsoto set out the Business Licence fees applicable for the 2009 financial

year.

Enacted by the Honiara City Council with the Assent of the Minister as follows:

L. This Ordinance may be cited as the Honiara City Council 2009 Rates and
Charges Amendment Ordinance and shall come into effect from IS¢
January 2009 and after it is assented to by the Minister of Home Affairs
in accordance with section 21(1) of the Honiara City Act 1999,

2. This Ordinance is to be read in conjunction with relevant Honiara City
Counci} by-laws and only those items specifically mentioned in
Schedule | are hereby amended for 2009 by this Ordinance, whilst all
other fees, rates and charges and fines contained therein each relevant
Honiara City Council by-law remains the same for 2009, unless altered
by any subsequent Ordinance.

3. Schedule 2 of this Ordinance sets out the Honiara City Council Business
Licence fees for 2009.

Passed and adopted by the Honiara City Council this 6th day of October 2008.

Cr. Andrew Mua
Mayor
Honiara City Council

Assented by the Honourable Minister for Minister for Home Affairs this 30th
day of December 2008.

Minister
Ministry of Home Affairs



%1 sked 106‘6$ aa0qe Xe], peoy aley oIseyg
Pue ‘paydusaxy 00s 64-1¢
%E1 oy uwcnb:m Tewadg (spue jo
%180 [ENUSpISay Anstun £q pautwieiop pue jo
%ET [eLisnpuy onfeA paroiduwirun uo poardde)
%E'T [eRIoWwoN) so1ey Aadoig dueuLy
wruee xod sonou xod (¢ [BIOIDMIIO))-UON] SIsulred] 2p SJUSWASIIOADY
Tad son0u 12d 000 z$ [eroIawmio;) ‘SI01I0N] 1qny 10§ SITULI9 g
uonesidde 1od ggg SJI0AN JOULIA
uonesrrdde 1od (g1 3uppmgyesnyoy $99,] Iapuay,
uoneordde 1ad (gg $99,] 901AIg $99,] 201A10G E8w< uoneySIUNUpY
SULVYA 6002 ddAL dDUNOS ANNTATY NOISIAIQ

600C YVIX YOI SHOAVHD ANV SHIVY
"TION0D ALID VIVINOH

I A'INAIHDS




Ieoh 10d 007 1S
(993 Ap1sqns) 1eak 19d QOp$
1804 12d 000 1$

$99, [00YOS
$99,] [00YDS

sjooyos AIBpuodag
sjooydg Arewrrg

$99,] [00YDS S[0OYDS YSI "uno)  uoredInpy
puowr xad 00g‘1$ SIONEI [TV L1 doyg dp) 3o [euey
yruow 1od 0L TS SIONIBIN IV o31e[ - sdoyg dp) }ooT [BIUSY
quuowr 1ad 000°‘1$ SIONIEIN IV [fewss - sdoyg dn yoo] [e1usy
Aep 1ad 719 S193IRIN IV dwey uo Jurjreq soue))
joo1s 1od ¢ ¢ SIOYIBIA [V S[00]S JO oX]
Keq 1od 01§ SIONIBN [V SpOOM 9I1,]
Aeq 10d 01§ S1NIRIN [V S[BLISIBIA SuIp[ing [e007]
Aeq 10d 01§ SN IEN [V POO pa3joo)
¥0o1q 1od Op$ SINIBIN 1TV J201g 291
Aep 1od worssas 1od 00g$ SN [V JNred
180 29 [[EH-SRNE JO 91T
moy 1od 0G$ SIONIBIN [V 90URIDJUOD-SATIIOB,] JO QM|
Aep/yyess 1od 01 SIYIBN [V (£1uo sor) maN) s[IeIS SumpopD
Aepyess 1od Q1§ SIONIEN [TV YrIopuely
Topuagyo 1ad 01§ S1NIB [V saur] Suryred
yred 1od ¢ ¢ SIONIBIA [V $99 Sumyreg
Aep 10d 1§ SIONIBIN [TV S9[BS INUOD0))
Kep/Ayso 1od G1¢ S1IdYIBN [TV MU0d0Y) 99,1 AYsq
Aep 1od/iess 1od g ¢ SI9NIBIN [V uayoIy) Aysg
Aep/A3iso 12d (7§ SIONIBN [IV USL 99, Aysy
Aep 1od/meis 1od g ¢ SIONIEN [V 99, 1o31BJA - sdo1))
8w 1ad 07§ S1IONIRIN [V 4st 28eI01S ANSiy IIAIIG
8w 1od 01¢ SIONIBIA [V $99,] 088103 1ONIB]A oI




Kiradoxd 10d 00S$
3urpying 1od mco, 1%
asnoy 1ad goz$

BIRTUOH urpim din sad (gg
qers 1ad (opg
. qers 13d go1¢

[euntue 1od 00 1g
[ewiue 1ad (ogg
[ewnue 1od oG ¢

Snaw o1qno 1ad gpg$
sroeidasar 1ad 06z

wnip 1d g01¢

peoj 1od moc.%
Peo[ 1ad (0g5$
peo] 12d 0p¢cg
peol 1ad ogeg

Aep 10d/30p 10d (7
Te24 1ad/3op 1od gCg

souepusne 1od poo‘1$
souepuane tod Oog ¢
oouepuae 10d (OO
Joog 1d 01§

pie) 1ad gg

s10Y10)
[BIOISWIIO))
90UdpISay

$99,] AIaAT[O(]
postel - sa[es qe[S
Sunjenbs - sofeg qejg

S[ewue [[ews Iay1()
sfewnue 9318
s1eD) 2 sSo(

9S0077-2pe1],

apeil,
(901A13s B11X0) [ERUSPISDY

Ansnpuy/ersurmon
L_ylQ - sjooyog
[1unoy - sjooyoag
SOUIPISIY

$93,] punog Socy
S99, So(g

[BIOIoWUIO,)
douapIsay
sjeog
syoog

§39,] p1B)

i QIBOIIID))
AduednooQ ypesyy Jo anssy

SQE[S Wnog,

[BWIUY peay

asnyoy

A1) - 509, ondog

spunod Jo¢y
3o

uonedmun,y -

SPIED) [ea1poy

Yoy

mjesy

e |



souayjo 10d 0Os$ o1e10d10)
oouajyjo 10d Q7 ¢ [enprAIpuj soury jodg
JUDWIDIOJUS |
souayjo 19d 000 1S SQUL] IONI"] Surenry me[
Souepuape 1od %oo.mw uoBuwIoI))
oaeId 10d OGT$ PIIYD
oarid 1ad 0ocs NPV §90,] 9ARID)
oan 12d 0GZ$ 00,1 Supmrwiay, 991y,
oon 10d QO¢s 39, Sumn) Jaug, SHIOAA
91801109 10d 0TS a1edNId)) JuIpjmg Jo anssy
jwzad 1ad QOS¢ SHWLIBJ UOHBABIX]] JO INSS]

1sonbar 10d Q01 ¢
uonoadsur xad OGT1$

uoroadsuy jerdadg
$990,] Uonoadsuy

99,4 uonpoadsuy
woipdddsuy g

ueld 1od 9gz$  [Bimsnpup Sunsixyg

ueld 1od 0gz$ [eisnpul MmsN

ueyd 10d 0gz$ [eroIvwmon) Sunisixyg

ueid 1od (G7$ [BIOISWITIO]) MON

ueld 10d Qgz$  2ouopisay Sunsixsy

uerd 1od 057§ Q0UIPISIY MIN $33] Suuue|g

%080 SI2YI0

%0S°0 [BIDISUILIO))

%SE0 [BLIUSPISOY nupg urpping suluuely




pealy 1od Ogg
uo1ssas 1od gogg
uo1ssos 12d 00ge
o1onb 10d

uorssas 1ad $1500
ANOLOo10 + 000°Z$

uo1ssas 1ad 1500
AL + 000°F$
$99,] QOUBNULY JO 9%()9

(AyoLnnore sopnjoun)
$99,{ YOUBIIUL] JO %06

dougpuone 1ad ¢ §
Aep 10d 067°1$

99,] fenuuy
S [ense))

o1 [ense))

OXH 13O

SIF] JUdAF snorioy

SIH

JUSAT] JUDUIUTBIIDIUS]
(A110119919 ou Ae(y)
oIIf] suodg pajerjiyy

JUSAT]

s110dg [ruoneN I0{RIN
§99,] WAD

WOOY 90UIIDJUOTY

suonet[iyy uodg

MO [[EqION QXK

N0D SN, axy

{ieH ssodan g-pinpy

UBWIOA 29
1odg ‘yynoy

|




{I.egal Notice No. 7}

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) ACT
(CAP. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (OMBUDSMAN) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2609

IM exercise of the powers conferred npon me by section 3 of the Constitutional
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations -

Citationand L These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms
comimencement - .. - . . <, . . \
and Conditions of Service} {Ombudsman) (Amendment) Regulations 2009, and

y
are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008.

Reulation 4 2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions
smended of Service) (Ombudsman) Regulations is amended in by deleting “$4,000” and

substituting “$3,000”.

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009.

Dr. Derek Sikua
PRIME MINISTER

{Legal Notice No. 8]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE ACT
(CAP. 84}

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE} (PUISNE JUDGES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make thease Regulations -



00°000°S
00°000°€
00°000°¢
00'080°1
00°091°C
00'0TE'v
00°091°C
00'000°C
00°000°C
00°000°C
00°000°C
00'000°C
00°000°C
00°000°LC
000801
00°0+9°8
00°0Z9°1
00091'C
00°091°C
00'080°1
00'00%'S
00'091°C
00°0¥9'8
00'0¥9°'8
00'0%9°8
00'091°C
00'0v9°8

BRI ASBABBAAD BB DD L RNEABAAALSHASH

$394 6007

(sdiys 1euoneuwrojur) sjuady Juiddiys

. $01ouddy Suijpueyy odie)

SIUA3 Y IIAIIS Y

Auedwio) Sunuipy usig

poum( A[B00T - SIJ1AISG AIINDIG
paumQ uSI10,] - $IOIAIG AILINDIS
201A10S dutd4 ], [B1IB10I00S

SOIOUAZY JUSWUNIIIY [BOO

SO10UQS Y AINJUSAPY 29 INOJ,

S1UR8 Y 29 SIAOIE SduUBINSU

$Jua8y Q0URIBI[D SWOISN))

sjuady podury 29 wodxy

SO0IAISS Juturexy,

$901A108 Juiyueyg

poum(Q A]18007]-5901A10S Sunipny

poumQ U31910, - SIIAIRS Junipny
SIOUOIINORI] [EJIPIN

JDIAISS JUBI[NISUOY) SSOUISng

SIOIAIOS I9AmET]

paumQ AJ[e207 - $901Aa135 Furkoang
poumQ u3doIo,] - $901a108 SuikaaIng
paumQ A[[BJ07] - UBIUNOODY Jjqnd PoIjIiId)
poumQ usIa1o,] - JUBJUNODY J1[qNd POLJIIIS))
$901410§ SutroauIduy] [IALD

poumQ udiao,] - sorueduro)) uoIIONISUO,)
paumQ AJ[BOOT - SIOIAIIS [RINIODNYDIY
paumQ uSII0,] - SIOIAIDG [BINIDNIYDIY

Ajapoy

SOJIAIOS [RUOISSIJOI]
SODIAISS [BUOISSIJOI]
$001AI0G [BUOISSIIOL]
$OOIAIDS [BUOISSIJOI]
$ODIAIDS [BUOISSIJOL]
SIDIAIIS [BUOISSITOI]
SODIAIOG [BUOISSIJOL]
$301A19S [BUOISSIJOI]
SIAIOG [BUOISSIJOI
SIDIAIOS [BUOISSIJOL]
$O01AIDS [BUOISSOJOI ]
SIDIAIDS [BUOISSIJOI]
SOOIAIOG [BUOISSIIOL]
SIDIAIRS [BUOISSIJOI]
SOOIAIRS [BUOISSOJOI]
$ODIAIOS [BUOISSIJOL]
SOOIAIOS [BUOISSIJOL]
SIDIAIIS [BUOISSIJOI]
SID1AIOS [BUOISSDJOI]
SIDIAIOS [BUOISSIJOI]
SIDIAIOG [BUOISSIJOL]
SOOIAIOS [BUOISSRJOI]
SIDIAIDS [BUOISSOJOL]
SIOIAIOS [BUOISSIIOL]
SODIATOS [BUOISSDJOI]
SIDIAIRS [BUOISSOTOL]
SO01AI0S [EUOISSIJOI]

£108938)




10
[Legal Notice No. 10]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS
OF SERVICE) ACT
(CAP. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (PUBLIC SOLICITOR) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 2009

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations —

ation and 1. These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms
mmencementand Conditions of Service) (Public Solicitor) (Amendment) Regulations 2009,
and are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008.

N 2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions
®aea"®  of Service) (Public Solicitor) Regulations is amended by deleting “$4,000” and
substituting “$5,000”.

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009.

Dr. Derek Sikua
PRIME MINISTER

Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the
Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Solomon Islands Printers Limited.




11

0000LC $ $31eS I0J0JN pIeoqinQ delicls)

000¥S  $ SIOTAIIG 9ISBAN 29 UOTBITURS [eIou9G
000¢9'T $ s101e19d(y MO, [e13U2D)

000¥TE $ S$3eS JeOY pUR d0UR)) [e1ouaD

000¥TE $ (PauonIpUOIY) S3[ES I[IYIA [elouaD

0008L°E $ (MIN) saTes 9[o1yaA [e1OUDD)

00'000'S $ $1UaS Y Q0URIBI[) ANSIO0,] SoLUSTpUf

00°080°'T § $J93O1], YoIRI0S saLnsnpuy

0091z ¢ SIPYLL SRy soLnsnpuy

0000¥'S $ SLINO saLnsnpuy

00'000°801$ ouise) saLsSnpu]
00000701 $ a8e1015 1oquuiy, 29 S0 soLsnpuj
00'009°IC $ $S900Yy preoy - 3oniy, 307 sarnsnpuj
00°00t'S $ 01O pasuadl] Auedwo)) Suidfo| soLnsnpuj
0000¥'S  $ uodxy ysty saLsnpuy
00'000°S  $ SUOIR]S UOISIAJ[Q], saLnsnpuj
00o00LT $ S9JIAIRG QUOY 9[IqOIN saLnsnpuy
00°0¥S $ UOIIEJTUNUILIOT) SSI[AIIA OIpey sarnsnpuy
00000 $ suonelg olpey saLisnpuj
00°000°LT $ UONROIUNUIWIOIII], saLnsnpuy
00°00LC $ 20130 pa1d)siSay - Sunoadsory saLnsnpuy
00°00%'S  $ IO paIvIsISoY-Furury soLnsnpu]
00°00+'S  $ a3e101§ [10 Wiey saLysnpuj
00080°T $ S1URdY 21eISH [y solnsnpuj
00080°T $ syonpoig AireQ saLnsSnpyj
00000 $ Suipaaxg ae) soLnsnpuj
00000°T $ IO WSHNOJ, 009 saLnsnpuy
00080‘'T ¢ Tedoyy 2147, soLsnpuy
00000 $ sjady Surdng ulf, %y [eR delos SoLnSnpu|
294 6002 Aoy K1030187)




12

e

00801 $ mN [a1eg [eIoUa0)
00°080°T $ Sumn) sa1y, [eIouan)
0091z $ Tedoy 2 sofeg 20Yg [BIouan
0091 § doysyoog snorSijoy [e1oua5)
000¥S ¢ [1e10y owioy [BIoUDn)
00018 ¢ doyg Aneag 2 19SS91(q Bl [eIoU2G)
00018 ¢ umQ A[[esog-1oyme], [elOIoUIUIO)) [eIoUDn)
00°080°T $ YJBIOIpURH 29 Sioefo1ry [eIoUOD)
00°080°T $ ['B19Y SUIYI0[) puep] puosog [eXoU2n)
00°0tvZE ¢ sued oredg [PIoUDn)
000917 $ doyg reonmooeuirey g [erouan
00°091°C § paum(Q ugia10,1-10118], [erOIowmIo,) [eIoU2D)
00°00v'S ¢ S[esafoyM Furygior) [eIouag
00'091°C ¢ A1oyeyg [eI0USC)
00°0Zev $ doyg [EI9N snoroard 2 Axoqppmo [ [eIaua0)
00°0ZEY $ SI9[ea(] plon [eIoUon
00'00LC doyg Juawdinby sj1o S [eIouan) 2eliels)
0000LT $ sdoyg [Ie19Y [eIouon) [e10U20)
00°00¥'S $ nedoyysoriddng uowidinby [BOLO9[ [e1ouan
00°00LC $ Sururexy, % SW1AIAS 101ndwo)) [e1ouan
00°0vT¢c $ $301A198 29 sofes 1omnduwio’) [BIoUDD)
0000LC $ doyg [re1ay Furgrop) [eIoUan)
00°00L°T $ doysyoog 7 Areuone)g [eIouan
00°00L°T $ doyg arempaepy [PIoUan)
00°08¥‘9 ¢ 9[eSIIOYM [eIoUAN [eIouan)
00°08¥'9 ¢ 1P3Ieuadng jerouacy [e10Uan)
00'8t9 ¢ sdoys dp ooy [eIouan
00°091°C $ doyssyiop 2 98emn [e1ouan

939 6002 Aanoy £103a3e




13

000¥S $ 9suddIT Joord Arerodway, Tonbry
00'080°T $ osueol ] 193%oRd 1onbry
00°0Z€Y $ SOSTWIAI] [BUOHIPPY 9[BSO[OUM Ionbr]
00'08%'9 $ QSUQOI 9[BSI[OUYAA 1onbr]
00'00¥'S $ (osudol] 199g [1e19Y) [1BI9Y 199y Ionbry
00'00C°91$ (9sud017 [N [1e10y) 181y (A Ionbry
00'080°T $ osnoy1saY UOIBPOUNUOOY
00'00¥'S $ 910N UOTBPOWIOddY
00'096CI$ [910H UOHBPOWILIONDY
00029°T $ so[es 98elolg ysL] poo.]
00°091'C $ Aroyoing poo,
000291 $ sied syjoeug pooq
00°0¥Z°€ $ JURINEISY OO,
00'080°T $ SYI0M SUIpPIOM $10}0e1U0))
00'080°T $ $10j0e1U0D) FuIqUIN] $1010e1U0D)
000ZEY $ $10J0B1JUOD) [BOLIIJ[] $1070B1UOD)
00'0ZEY $ umQ,1-1030enuo)) ureaurduyg $1030B1JUO))
00°0v9'S $ poum() ugrol1o,J-1010e13U0)) SurIdauIus $1010e1U0D)
0000LT $ paumQ A1[e0071-10)001)sU0Y) JUIp[mng SI030vIIU0D)
00'0¥9'8 § paum(Q ud1a1o,~103on1su0) Jurp[ing $I0J0BI11U0))
00'000°T $ spueg [eOISNIA JUOWIUIRLIIUS]
00°00t'S $ sqnpD WY3IN JUSWIUIRYIO}UE]
00849 $ sqnpD Arejondorg JUSWIULB1IONUS
000291 $ O9pIA/BWIAUID JUSWIUTR) 1)U




14

ors $ Ioquay dway, 19 Sn[d asuadry o qnpd Ionbr]
0801 ¢ TOQUISIN| 19 SN[ 9SUDTT [N qniDH zonbry
00°00¥'S$ ISUAOTT [0 qUID onbry
00'091°C$ OSUIIT [B1IUIPISIY Ionbry
00801 $ AB(] [BUOLIIPPY 9SUADIT 193¢ [BUOISBIO() Ionbr
00°0¥S $ AB( 1ST 9SUIOIT 199 [RUOISEII() lonbr |
00801 ¢ sAe(] [EUOLIPPY ASUADIT [[N] [BUOISEIOQ) Tonbry
00°080°T$ AB(T IST 9SUADITT [N, [BUOISEID() Ionbr
000vS $ [EAOWIY ASUIDIT JUBINBISIY/ULdIqNd Ionbr
00801 $ I9JSUBRI], 9SUQDITT JUBINBISIY /UL [qnd Ionbr
000rS $ UOISUIIXH SIH 9SUIOIT JUBINBISI/UedI[qn ] Ionbrp
00°00t'S$ OSUIOTT JUBINEISIY Ionbr
00'08L°€$ 9SUQOI'] 109 g SurdIqn ] Ionbi1
00'0ZEV$ 9SUA0IT [[nd SuBdIQN] Ionbrp




Short Title &
Commencement

Authorisation of
the lssue of SBD
$20,936,988
from the City
Fund

15

HONIARA CITY ACT 1999
(No. 9 of 1999)

The Honiara City Council
Appropriation Ordinance 2009

AN ORDINANCE

TO

Appropriate Twenty Million Nine Hundred and Thirty Six Thousand Nine
Hundred and Eighty Eight dollars to the services of the financial year ending 315
December 2009.

Enacted by the Honiara City Council with the Assent of the Minister as follows:

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Honiara City Council
Appropriation Ordinance 2009 and shall come into effect on the date it is
assented to by the Minister of Home Affairs in accordance with section 35(2) of
the Honiara City Act 1999,

2. The issue of the sum of Twenty Million Nine Hundred and Thiny
Six Thousand Nine Hundred and Eighty Eight dollars to the services of the
financial year ending 315! December 2009.

3. The sum specified in the preceding section shall be appropriated
for the supply of Heads and Subheads specified in the Schedule and in the
amounts respectively in relation thereto.

Passed and adopted by the Honiara City Council this 6th day of QOctober 2008.

Cr. Andrew Mua
Mayor
Honiara City Council

Assented by the Honourable Minister for Minister for Home Affairs this 3pth day
of December 2008.

Minister
Ministry of Home Affairs



PO SISIULLJ SPURIST UOWOINS AQ PAULIg

JUSWUIIA0L) SPUR|S] UOWO[CS
Y1 Jo ATLIOYINT 3Y) Idpun pajull]
SPUR|S] UOIO[OS “BITIUOH

16

886°9£6°0Z$ aanypuddxy] eide) pu JUIIINIIY IBJO], pUBLs)
000°09. % jgpopqny

0007091 § SHIOAA LT
000001  § [BOIPIIN 2% Ui[Bald 01
000°9L $ adueuly ol
000vcy $ uonensiupy 70i

aImIpuodyLT [ende )

$86°9LT°02% [®103qng
66£999 & : juowdIojus me] Q1
LTV PO T $ SIVIAIG PYIBIN 601
119°6SO°'T § SV 8 ,USWOM 2 110dS ‘Yinox 801
9I6't6EY $ SYIOM  L0T
€611y § Suruuelg 901
7T60E1T $ [EOIPAIN 29 MBS SOI
106°LOL°E $ uoneonpy 01
68t LP0T $ soueuLf €01
0£0°620°C $ uonenSIUIUPY 701
001°62€'C ¢ PO S 04BN 101

IMIpUdd Y JUaLIMosy

IMIPHIAXT] poSLIoiny “SIBMOnIE] spes

A INAAHDS




