5

S U P P LEM EN T to the Solomon Islands Gazette

Wednesday 180  February, 2009 S.I. No.4

[Legal Notice No. 3]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS
OF SERVICE) ACT
(CAP. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS
OF SERVICE) (COMMISSIONER OF POLICE) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 2009

. IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations —

Citationand 1. These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms
and Conditions of Service) (Commissioner of Police) (Amendment) Regulations
2009, and are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008.

Regulation 4 2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and
amended Conditions of Service) (Commissioner of Police) Regulations is amended by
deleting ““$4,000” and substituting “$5,000”.
Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009.

Dr. Derek Sikua
PRIME MINISTER




[Legal Notice No. 4]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS
OF SERVICE) ACT
(CAP. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (AUDITOR GENERAL) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 2009

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations —

Citation and 1. These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms
commencement  and Conditions of Service) (Auditor General) (Amendment) Regulations 2009,
and are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008.

_ 2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions
eenid™* of Service) (Auditor General) Regulations is amended by deleting ‘$4,000” and
substituting “$5,000”.
Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009.

Dr. Derek Sikua
PRIME MINISTER

[Legal Notice No. 5]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS
OF SERVICE) ACT
(CAP. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC PROSECUTIONS)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations —



Citatien ard
commencemen;

Regulation 4
amended

Citation and
commencement

Regulation 4
amended

1. These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms
and Conditicns of Service) {Director of Public Prosecutions) (Amendment)
Regulations 2009, and are deemed to have come into force on ! January 2608.

2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions
of Service} (Director of Public Prosecutions) Regulations is amended Wy deleting
“$4,000™ and substituting “$3,000”.

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009.

Dr. Derek Sikuva
PRIME MINISTER

(Legal Notice No. 6]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS
OF SERVICE) ACT
(CAP. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (CHAIRPERSON PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations

1L These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms
and Conditions of Service) (Chairperson Public Service Commission)
(Amendment; Regulations 2009, and are deemed to have come into force on 1
January 2008.

2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions
of Service) {Chairperson Public Service Commission) Regulations is amended by
deleting 84,000 and substituting **$5,000”.

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009.

Dr. Derek Sikua
PRIME MINISTER




{L.egal Notice No. 7]
CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) ACT
{CAP. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (OMBUDSMAN) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations —

Citation and L These Reguiations are cited the Coustitutional Offices (Terms
Ceminenene nl i

and Conditions of Service} (Ombudsman) {Amendment) Regulations 2009, and
are deemed 1o have come into force on 1 January 2008.

Regulation 4 2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions
smapded P . s . . . )
smended of Service) (Ombudsman) Regulations is amended in by deleting “S4,000” and

substituting “$5,000”.

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009.

Dr. Derek Sikua
PRIME MINISTER

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE ACT
(CAP. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (PUISNE JUDGES) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2009

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutiona!
Offices {Termns and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations -



Citation and
commengement

Reguliion 4
amended

Citation and
cOminencement

Regulativn 4
amended

9

1. These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms
and Conditions of Service) (Puisne Judges) (Amendment) Regulations 2009, and
are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008.

2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions
of Service) Regulations (“principal Regulations) is amended by deleting “$5,000”
and substituting “$5,384.62’.

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009.

Dr. Derek Sikua
PRIME MINISTER

[Legal Notice No. 9]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) ACT
(CAP. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (CHIEF JUSTICE) (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2049

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, I make these Regulations ~

L. These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms
and Conditions of Service) (Chief Justice) (Amendment) Regulations 2002, and
are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008.

2. Regulation 4 of the Constituticnal Gffices (Terms and Conditions
of Service) (Chief Justice) Reguiations (“principal Regulations) is amended by
deleting “$5,000” and substituting “$5,961.54".

Dated at Floniara this thirteenth day of February, 2009.

Dr. Derek Sikua
PRIME MINISTER




10
[Legal Notice No. 10]

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS
OF SERVICE) ACT
(CAP. 84)

CONSTITUTIONAL OFFICES (TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF
SERVICE) (PUBLIC SOLICITOR) (AMENDMENT)
REGULATIONS 2009

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 3 of the Constitutional
Offices (Terms and Conditions of Service) Act, [ make these Regulations —

wation and 1. These Regulations are cited the Constitutional Offices (Terms
ommencementand Conditions of Service) (Public Solicitor) (Amendment) Regulations 2009,
and are deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2008.

. 2. Regulation 4 of the Constitutional Offices (Terms and Conditions
Shid"* of Service) (Public Solicitor) Regulations is amended by deleting “$4,000"” and
substituting “$5,000”.

Dated at Honiara this thirteenth day of February, 2009.

Dr. Derek Sikua
PRIME MINISTER

Honiara, Solomon Islands
Printed under the authority of the
Solomon Islands Government

Printed by Solomon Islands Printers Limited.



