
851 

SUPPLEMENT to the Solomon Islands Gazette 

Thursday 

[Legal :\'otice :\'0. 155] 

:\ovember, 2010 

IIO:\IARA CITY ACT 1999 
(Act ~o. 2 of 1999) 

nO:\IARA CITY COL~CIL (2011 APPROPRIATIO~ 
CO:\SEQCE:\TIAL A:\1E~D:\1E:\T) ORDER 2010 

S.l. :\"0.71 

WHEREAS pursuant to sections 6 and 9 of the Honiara City Act, the election of 

members of the Honiara City Council was due to have been held on 27 August 20 I 0 

after the Council was dissolved at midnight on 26 August 2010 on the expiration of 

the term of four years of the Council after the last election; 

WHEREAS the holding of the general elections for :\'ational Parliament during the 

same period did prevent or hinder the holding of the election on 27 August 2010, as 
rcquired under the Honiara City Act; 

WHEREAS:the next election of members of the Honiara City Council is due to be 

held on 8 December 20 I 0 (Legal:\, otice 137 of 20 10); 

WHEREAS to ensure the proper functioning of Honiara City Council, estimates of 
the revenue and expenditure of the Council for the 2011 financial year mllst be 
approved and related Ordinances enacted by the Council by 1 January 20 11; 

WHEREAS certain fees, rates and charges need to adjusted, as a result of the 2011 
estimates of the revenue and expenditure of the Council reflected in the Honiara 
City Council (2011 Appropriation Order) 201 0, and it is essential that these 

adjustments come into force by 1 January 2011; 

I THEREFORE make this Order pursuant to section 72 of the Act due to the 
unforeseen and special circumstances set out in the recitals above to amend the 
Honiara City Council (Fees, Rates and Charges) Ordinance 2009 -



Citation 

Amendment 
of Honiara 
City Council 
(Fees, Rates 
and Charges) 
Ordinance 
2009 -­
Schedule I 

852 

1. (I) This Order may be cited as the Honiara City Council 
(2011 Appropriation Consequential Amendment) Order 2010 and commences on 
I January 20 I 1. 

(2) This Order may be replaced by an Ordinance made by 
the new Council. 

2. Schedule 1 of the Honiara City Council (Fees, Rates and Charges) 
Ordinance 2009 is amended as follows: 

(a) the fourteenth item under 'YIarket Services' (titled "Ice 
Block - All YIarkets') is amended by deleting the figure 
"$45" and substituting the figure "$50". 

(b) the twenty third item under 'YIarket Services' (titled 
'Rental Lock L'p Shops - Kukum') is amended by 
deleting the figure "$ 1 ,600" and substituting the figure 
"$ 1 ,000". 

(c) the fOLllth and fifth items under 'Planning' (titled 'Issue 
of Excavation Permits' and 'Issue of Building Certificate') are 
repealed and replaced with the following items: 

Development :\"ew Building $ 100 per 
appl ication fee Construction application 
(collected for 
Honiara Town & 
Country 
Planning Board) 

Extension to existing building $30 per 
application 

Other $10 per 
application 

Report requested 
by Commissioner 
of Lands 

$ 100 per report 

Stage inspection $ ISO per 
under section inspection 
13(2) of the 
IIoniamCit).' 
Council BUilding 
Ordinance 



853 

3. Schedule 2 of the Honiara City Council (Fees, Rates and 
Charges) Ordinance 2009 is amended as follows: 

Amendment of 
Honiara City 
COlmcil (Fees. 
Rates and 

f
· . Charges) 

___________ -...I..(~a)'___.2'l~'h~e~o~lI~o~wu.i!.!.ni:i>.g_!.lt~e:.!.!mc!.!s"-.:(~ar:..=e....!i2..!n~se::.!rt~e~d~(~'lt:....!t:!.'h~e....':b~c:5g2..!in2..!n2..!l~n5..g_':o~f....':t~he~-----OOrdinance-20llL 

Schedule: Schedllle2 

Dilities Oil Company - Petrol S 10,800 

Uilities Oil Company - Diesel S10,800 

l;tilities Oil Company - Kerosene S10,800 

l;til ities Oil Company - Aviation Gas S10,800 

(b) The fifth and sixth items under 'Public Transport' 
(titled 'Pickup 3 ton & below vehicles' and 'Pickup 3 
ton & above vehicle') are repealed and replaced with 
the following items: 

Public Transport Pickup below 3 ton vehicles S216 

Public Transport Pickup 3 ton & above vehicles S540 

DATED AT HO~IARA this twenty-third day of~ovember 2010. 

~A~ASSEH ~AELA~GA 

Deputy Prime ~inister and ~inister for Home Affairs 



[Legal -"'" otice -"'"0. 156] 

854 

1I0~IARA CITY ACT 1999 
(Act ~o. 2 of 1999) 

1I0~IARA CITY COC~CIL (2011 APPROPRIATIO~) ORDER 2010 

WlIEREAS pursuant to sections 6 and 9 of the Honiara City Act, the election of 
members of the Honiara City Council was due to have been held on 27 August 
2010 after the Council was dissolved at midnight on 26 August 2010 on the 
expiration of the term of four years of the Council after the last election; 

WHEREAS the holding of the general elections for -","ational Parliament during 
the same period did prevent or hinder the holding of the election on 27 August 
20 I 0, as required under the Honiara City Act; 

WlIEREAS the next election of members of the Honiara City Council is due to 
be held on 8 December 2010 (Legal -"'"otice 137 of 2010); 

WlIEREAS to ensure the proper functioning of Honiara City Council, estimates 
of the revenue and expenditure of the Council for the 2011 financial year must be 
approved and related Ordinances enacted by the Council by I January 2011; 

WHEREAS there will be insufficient time for new members of Honiara City 
Council to approve such estimates and enact sueh Ordinances; 

I THEREFORE make this Order pursuant to section 72 of the Act due to the 
unforeseen and special circumstances set out in the recitals above -

itation 1. (l) This Order may be cited as the Honiara City Council 

utholisation and 
'propliation of 
3.8J!6.801 

(2011 Appropriation) Order 2010 and commences on 1 January 2011. 

(2) This Order may be replaced by an Appropriation 
Ordinance made by the new Council. 

2. (l) The issue from the City Fund of a sum of S23,846,804 
(Twenty Three :\lillion, Eight Hundred and Forty-Six Thousand and Eight 
Hundred and Four Dollars) is authorised, to be applied to the service of the year 
ending 3 I December 20 I 1. 

(2) The sum specified in subparagraph (1) shall be 
appropriated for the supply of the heads specified, and 
in the amounts respectively specified in relation to such heads, 
in the Schedule. 



855 

(3) The 2011 Estimates of revenue and expenditure are 
deemed to have been laid before the City Council and 
recommended by the respective Standing Committee. 

SCHEDCLE 

(paragraph 2) 

Heads Particulars Authorised Expenditure 

RECL'RRE~T EXPE~DITL'RE 

00 ~ayor's Office S 2,267,303 

10 Administration S 2,168.152 

15 Finance S 1,919,102 

20 Central ~arket Services S 1,278,029 

25 Kukum ~arket Services S 191,557 

30 Lands & Planning S 581,654 

35 Works S 4,740,720 

40 Law Enforcement S 1,105,555 

45 Youth, Sport and Women's S 993,545 

50 Education S 818,354 

55 Health & ~edical Services S 1,964,833 

70 Rapid Employment Scheme S 4,802,000 

Subtotal $22,830,804 



Honiara, Solomon Islands 
Printed under the authority of the 

Solomon Islands Government 

Printed by Solomon Islands Printers Limited. 


