
REPUBLIQUE 

DE 

VANUATU 

JOURNAL OFFICIEL 

4 AVRIL 2014 

SONT PUBLIES LES TEXTES SUiVANTS 

EXTRAORDINARY GAZETTE 
NUMERO SPECIAL 

NO. 11 

REPUBLIC 

OF 

VANUATU 

OFFICIAL GAZETTE 

4 APRIL 2014 

NOTIFICATION OF PUBLICATION 

ORDER 

INTERNATIONAL COMPANIES ACT [CAP 2221 

• INTERNATIONAL COMPAN IES (FOREIGN 
INVESTOR'S UNDERTAKING) REGULATION 
(AMENDMENT) ORDER NO. 58 OF 2014 

IMMIGRATION ACT NO. 17 OF 2010 

• IMMIGRATION VISA REGULATION 
(AMENDMENT) ORDER NO. 59 OF 2014 

LEGAL NOTICE 

REPRESENTATION OF THE PEOPLE ACT 
[CAP. 146] 

• PUBLICATION OF THE LIST OF 
CANDIDATES FOR THE PORT VILA 
CONSTITUENCY BY ELECTION 
NOTICE NO. 121 OF 2014 



REPUBLIC OF VANUATU 

INTERNATIONAL COMPANIES ACT [CAP 222] 

International Companies (Foreign Investor's Undertaking) 
Regulation (Amendment) 

Order NO!)'8of2014 

In exercise of the powers conferred on me by subsection 131 (1) of the 
International Companies Act [CAP 222] and on the advice of the Commission, I, 
the Honourable MAKI STANLEY SIMELUM Minister of Finance and Economic 
Management, make the following Order. 

1 Amendments 
The International Companies (Foreign Investor's Undertaking) Regulation Order 
No. 142 of2012 is amended as set out in the Schedule. 

2 Commencement 
This Order commences on the day on which it is made. 

":2 v- c{ 
Made at Port Vila this _ .:J ___ day of --.:....~_~ __ 

International Companies (Foreign Investor's Undertaking) Regulation (A mendment) Order No. 5'6 
0/2014 1 



SCHEDULE 

AMENDMENTS OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
COMPANIES (FOREIGN INVESTOR'S UNDERTAKING) 

REGULATION ORDER NO. 142 OF 2012 

1 Paragraph 3(c) 
Delete "25% of the funds deposited by the investor in the name and for the 
account of the company" substitute "US$60,000" 

2 Paragraph 3(d) 
Delete "the remaining 25% of the funds" substitute "US$60,000" 

3 Paragraph 3(e) 
Delete "50% of the remaining funds" substitute "the remaining US$50,000" 

International Companies (Foreign Investor 's Undertaking) Regulation (Amendment) Order No. 65 
0/2014 2 



REPUBLIC OF VANUATU 

IMMIGRATION ACT NO. 17 OF 2010 

Immigration Visa Regulation (Amendment) 
Order No.5CfOf2014 

In exercise of the powers conferred on me by paragraph 37(g) and section 91 of 
the Immigration Act No. 17 of2010, I, the Honourable PAUL BARTHELEMY 
TELUKLUK Minister of Internal Affairs, make the following Order. 

. 1 Amendments 
The Immigration Visa Regulation Order No. 180 of2011 is amended as set out in 
the Schedule. 

2 Commencement 
This Order commences on the day on which it is made. 

Made at Port Vila this 0 Lt 

Immigration Visa Regulation (Amendment) Order No.51 0/2014 



SCHEDULE 

AMENDMENTS OF THE IMMIGRATION VISA 
REGULATION ORDER NO. 180 OF 2011 

1 Paragraph 12{4A)(a) 
Delete "260,000" (wherever occurring) substitute "1 70,000" 

2 SCHEDULE 1, Table 2 
Delete ttem 12A, substitute 

lLA Kesidence VIsa e.,.n applIcant who 5UU,UUU 
fulfils the criteria 
and meets the 
conditions set out 
in subclauses 
12(4A) and (4B), 
the spouse and 
dependants of the 
applicant who are 
resident with the 
applicant, a full 
tIme student who 
is .singl~ resident 
With an 
dependent upon 
the applicant or a 
parent of the 
applicant or 
spouse, over the 
age of 65, resident 
WIth and 
dependent upon 
the applicant-7 
years with right of 
renewal 

3 Schedule 2-ROAD MAP OF THE CAPITAL INVESTMENT 
IMMIGRATION PLAN 

(a) Paragraph 4.(a) 

Delete "260,000" substitute "1 70,000" 

(b) Paragraph 4.(c) 

Repeal the paragraph substitute 

"(c) Expedition Fee: 

(i) if the applicant wishes to be granted citizenship within 9 
months from the grant of the residence permit under 
paragraph 13C(1)(b) ofthe Citizenship Act [CAP 112], the 

Immigration Visa Regulation (Amendment) Order No. 5Qoj 2014 2 



applicant's company must waive repayment of 
Government bonds and donate to the Vanuatu 
Government a further 25% of the investor's investment 
as therein provided by way of transfer of shares in 
Capital Investment Immigration Fund Ltd. 

(ii) If the applicant wishes to be granted citizenship within 3 
months from the grant of the residence permit the 
applicant's company must waive repayment of its 
government bonds and transfer to the Vanuatu 
Government all of its shares in Capital Investment 
Immigration Fund Ltd." 

(c) Clause 4A 

Delete "350,000" substitute "260,000" 

(d) Paragraph 5.(a) 
(i) Delete "150,000" substitute "100,000" 
(ii) Delete "100,000" substitute "75,000" 

(iii) Delete "50,000" substitute "25,000" 

(e) Paragraph 5.(b) 

Repeal the paragraph. 

(f) Paragraph 5.(c) 

(i) Re-Ietter the paragraph as (b) 
(ii) Delete "100,000" substitute "11 0,000" 

(iii) Delete "85,000" substitute "95,000" 

(g) Paragraphs 6.(a) and (b) 
Delete "25%" substitute "US$60,000" 

(h) Paragraph 6.(c) 
Delete "50%" substitute "US$50,000" 

(i) Clause 8 

Repeal the clause. 

Immigration Visa Regulation (Amendment) Order No.sq of2014 3 



REPUBLIC OF VANUATU 

THE ELECTORAL COMMISSION 

PUBLICATION OF THE LIST OF CANDIDATES FOR THE PORT VILA CONSTITUENCY 
BY ELECTION NOTICE No:\2...1 OF 2014 

Pursuant to sections 27 and 28 of the Representation of the People Act - [CAP. 146], THE ELECTORAL 

COMMISSION HEREBY PUBLISHES the list of names of additional candidates qual ified to contest the Port 

Vila Constituency by-election scheduled to be held on Tuesday 15th April 2014. 

1. CONSTITUENCY OF PORT VILA: 1 VACANT SEAT (2 CANDIDATES) 

CANDIDATE AFFILIATION 

1. ALiCK GEORGE NOEL 

2. ABEL DAVID 

INDEPENDENT CANDIDATE 

VETE ALLIANCE PARTY 

MADE AT PORT VILA THIS TUESDAY THE 1ST OF APRIL 2014. 

JOHN KILLION TALEO 

CHAIRMAN 

#~~ J v , .. ;''---,.:.::,1' ,~ 
li t:.:) , ;;:.. " 'I ~I El.EC1URP\ \~ w, Cf'Ai1041SSlOi't \ C \~ 

_---::::="a:~j ~~' ~_SE1L DES J "c' i~ 
~. "nONS //? II 

... "'W-,-,,:/-
~ - - /,0 

'<~ 'l.le -_=-O'" 
______ ARTI N J TETE 

~ MEMBER 

LlNNES M TARIANGA 

MEMBER 




